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Our future is urban and the health impacts of that urbanisa-
tion are a concern internationally, nationally and locally
within NSW. In 2008, for the first time in history, half the
world’s population will live in cities.1 Growth in urban areas
now accounts for the world’s entire net population growth.1

Australia is already one of the most urbanised countries in
the world, with more than three quarters of the population
living in urban areas.2 The NSW population, over six
million, grew by almost 10% in the past decade.2

This issue of the NSW Public Health Bulletin builds on the
growing interest in the impact of urbanisation in NSW and
focuses on the contribution of health impact assessment
(HIA) to sustainable urbanisation. The recently released
State Plan: a new direction for NSW 3 is a timely reminder
that health has an active role in the growth and sustainability
of the state. The issue shows that our investment in HIA
helps the health sector to better consider the health impacts
of urbanisation.

The issue builds on the experience of the NSW HIA project
over the past five years. Funded by NSW Health and led by
the Centre for Health Equity Training Research and
Evaluation, the project has developed the capacity of the
health system to undertake HIA. The central element of the
project has been ‘learning by doing’,4 by undertaking HIAs
on policy, program and project proposals. As part of this
work, HIAs have been conducted on proposals that directly
influence sustainable urban planning; many of these have
been described as case studies in this issue.

The NSW Health Impact Assessment Project has formed
strong relationships between project participants and
colleagues and experts in HIA and in the field of healthy

urban planning internationally, nationally and locally within
NSW. Many of these colleagues have contributed to this
special issue. 

Four important messages concerning HIA, health and
urbanisation are presented.

The first message reinforces the growing understanding that
human well-being and the impacts of urbanisation are
closely related.5 Local and international authors with expe-
rience in HIA, health and urban planning provide similar
arguments that:
• health and urban planning are inextricably linked
• further action is required and
• HIA provides real opportunities to progress this action.

The second message is that HIA has been proven to be a
mechanism by which health and other sectors involved in
sustainable urbanisation can move beyond recognition of
common concerns to concrete action. The HIA case
studies included in this issue emphasise the value of con-
structive engagement using the structured and stepwise
approach of HIA.

The third message, highlighted by the case studies on the
Bungendore, Lower Hunter and Illawarra impact assess-
ments (see Gow et al.; Wells et al.; Furber et al.; this issue),
is that HIA should not be limited to urbanisation in big
cities. The proportional growth in regional centres and rural
towns often dwarfs that occurring in large cities and the
impact on existing resources, physical and social infrastruc-
ture can be enormous. This situation is not unique to
Australia. As noted in the State of the World Population
2007 report ‘contrary to general belief, the bulk of urban
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population growth is likely to be in smaller cities and
towns, whose capabilities for planning and implementa-
tion can be exceedingly weak’.1

The fourth message is that successfully responding to the
future challenges and opportunities of urbanisation will
require a range of actions such as:

• a shift towards healthy public policy increasing the
capacity of the health sector to engage intersectorally
on urban planning

• understanding the regulatory framework that governs
urban planning in NSW

• learning from past lessons concerning advocating for
health as part of urbanisation and

• building on the strengths of, and meeting the
challenges set by, HIA in NSW to date.

At all levels of the urbanisation debate – global, national
and local, it is apparent that health must become actively

engaged in order to enhance the sustainability of planning
activities. HIA is now established as one tool to facilitate
that engagement. This issue of the Bulletin shows that
NSW is now in a position, as a world leader on HIA, to
support the pivotal future role that urbanisation will play
in influencing the health of populations and communities.
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The burden of preventable chronic disease is rapidly
increasing in New South Wales.1 If the potential for pre-
venting chronic diseases is not fully harnessed, it is pro-
jected that treatment costs alone for people with diabetes,
cardiovascular disease, cancers and musculoskeletal con-
ditions in NSW will rise from approximately $3.3 billion
in 2000–01 to $6.1 billion by 2020–21.2 Addressing this
challenge will require a multifactorial approach and there
is a growing body of evidence around the links between
risk factors apportioned to increasing urbanisation and,
more broadly, to the built environment.3–5 Creating

environments that promote health can play a significant
role in reducing rates of death and disability from chronic
disease.6 Compounding the challenge of addressing poten-
tially avoidable chronic diseases is the sustainability of our
urban communities, with increasing populations in and
around Sydney and coastal NSW in particular. For
example, over the next 20 years, population increases of
over 50% are expected in several coastal townships.7

The importance of urban planning for health has been
identified as a key priority for the NSW Government as
described in the: NSW State Plan,8 NSW State Health
Plan,9 Healthy People NSW,10 and the NSW Population
Health Priority Taskforce. In particular, Healthy People
NSW identifies health impact assessment (HIA) as a key
tool for affecting change and to strengthen health input
into planning decisions.10

While in NSW it is local government planners and urban
designers who have the ability to directly influence and
shape the urban environment, NSW Health is increasing its
engagement at both a state and regional level. This issue of
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